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Stearns Weaver Miller Names Three New Shareholders 
 
MIAMI, FL — September 26, 2017 — Stearns Weaver Miller announced that Jacob T. Cremer 
from the Firm’s Tampa office and Matthew M. Graham and Jenea M. Reed from the Firm’s 
Miami office have been promoted to Shareholder.  
 
“Jake, Matt and Jenea are excellent lawyers,” said Managing Director Rick Schatz. “We look 
forward to their continued success as shareholders.” 
 
Jacob T. Cremer counsels clients in their interactions with local, state, and federal governments 
on environmental, land use, and land development issues. He has extensive experience 
securing environmental and land use permits and protecting against challenges, defending 
government enforcement suits, and litigating property rights issues, including before the United 
States Supreme Court. Jake routinely assists large landowners on long-term strategic planning 
for their holdings. He is on the Board of Directors for the Hillsborough County Farm Bureau and 
is a gubernatorial appointee to the Tampa Bay Regional Planning Council. Jake earned his J.D. 
and Masters of Science in Planning from Florida State University.  View Jake’s full bio.  
 
Matthew M. Graham is a litigator who focuses on bankruptcy cases and complex commercial 
disputes. He represents a wide variety of clients, including real estate developers, financial 
institutions, bankruptcy trustees, corporate officers and directors, securities investors, and 
merchant lenders in state and federal court and in arbitration. He has significant experience 
litigating cases involving claims for breach of fiduciary duties, director and officer misconduct, 
commercial torts, and fraudulent transfers. Matt earned his J.D. from the University of Miami 
School of Law and, before joining the firm, he served as a law clerk in the U.S. Bankruptcy Court 
for the Southern District of Florida. View Matt’s full bio.  
 
Jenea M. Reed handles all facets of complex commercial litigation. She has litigated a variety of 
high-profile business disputes, including contract and business torts litigation, in state and 
federal trial and appellate courts. Recently, Jenea was a member of a team that successfully 
appealed an erroneous judgment and achieved a complete defense verdict in the subsequent 
retrial. She also serves her community as a mentor with Big Brothers Big Sisters of Miami. Jenea 
earned her J.D., summa cum laude, from the University of Miami School of Law, and then 
clerked for Judge Adalberto Jordan of the United States Court of Appeals for the Eleventh 
Circuit. View Jenea’s full bio.  
 
Contact  
Jacob T. Cremer | Tampa | 813-222-5051 | jcremer@stearnsweaver.com 
Matthew M. Graham | Miami | 305-789-3473 | mgraham@stearnsweaver.com 
Jenea M. Reed | Miami | 305-789-3426 | jreed@stearnsweaver.com 
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About Stearns Weaver Miller 

Stearns Weaver Miller is a full service law firm with offices in Miami, Fort Lauderdale, Tampa 
and Tallahassee, Florida. We offer multidisciplinary solutions with a concentration on Business 
Restructuring, Corporate & Securities, Labor & Employment, Land Development, Zoning & 
Environmental, Litigation & Dispute Resolution, Real Estate and Tax. For more information, visit 
stearnsweaver.com.  
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